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This lecture delves into the academics of investing. 
Attendees will gain an understanding of the 
compounding of interest, familiarize themselves with 
basic investment terms and definitions, explore 
common investor biases, and learn about the 
fundamental reasons and academic approaches to 
investing. This session is designed to provide a solid 
foundation in investment principles, empowering 
attendees to make informed decisions in their investing 
endeavors. 
  

Sylvan Schwartz and Ryan Peel Co-Founded The 
Financial Wellness Institute, whose mission is to 
provide lawyers with education, setting the stage for 
long-term fiscal success. Drawing from over 20 
years of combined expertise in financial wellness, 
our team provides tailored advice to support legal 
professionals at every stage of their careers. Our 
goal is to equip the legal community with the 
financial knowledge and tools necessary to achieve 
both professional success and personal fulfillment 
through sound financial practices. For additional 
information, please visit: www.fwinstitute.com. 
 


